2022 &1 fae G . oo -

S o 8 fieell SRR @ |9l @1 (A9 v W) (SeieE) fade,
2022

I IS 87 fReel WRAR & A &1 (999 9 v ) AfdfgE, 1004 # g Heee
FH & forg

e

faes

WRA VRS & g8d¥d I8 A U o &89 ot furrmn g o8 91 w0 9
sffafaa fear sme—

1. <iftra Mde vF g — (1) 39 R @ i o & el WReR @
AR @1 (@9 Td W) (SEeE) STiRIfTaE, 2022 HET O |
2) UE SUTOUA ERI WNGHI IO # AeRgET gR1 geonfaa fafyr |
U< BT |

2. URT 3 &I HIOEN — AL Ao &7 {eell WeR # AR &1 (qa9 g +w)
At E, 1994 (1995 &1 ool fafTm 8) (9@ Uvema "o fEf s’ & w9 #
Hefdia) o axT 3 ® —

(@) SwRT (1) ¥ 9N FOR TW’ T B WM W WO FOR BW TRl B
gforenfaa fosar srg;

(@) STRT (2) # "U& TR 90" ¥@&I & WH W "T6 g9R Ud |l 30" el
1 uforenfa far e,

() STRT (3) # “3BRE TOR TUY' YR & WM R "N TR TU’ Iq] B
gfeenfua feear smom:

(8) SUERT (4) § U9 §OR ¥W” UKl @ WH W TG g Ud weg] B
wfcrenfae fhar ST

(S) STINT 4 & U =1 f=faRed SwmRt & afsfdee fear smom; sierta—

“6) YRP BB B O T B WY U™F HA DI due™, fdRd
GUGIERCIRCI



(e)mﬁﬁmuwﬁmﬁwﬁm@uﬁﬂﬂmmmwm
ST |

3. GRT 4 BT WA A RAFTH A a=7 4 F "I TR BT’ AL D WH | T
TR B0 Rt By yfewenfya frar wmeem,

4. gRT 6 BT GINET —

(tr)mw(zx)#“a‘rmm"ma‘fa?wq?"a\qmm”v@ﬁﬁwﬁﬁ
mm;

() ST 4 & 9 = FeEfaled SR B wfhfive fear e st

"BV FEN WEW B WU F AU ddEE B NeR e e B TG T IRE AG B
9% BT g Ifim args ol o9 @ i u 8rm |

(S)WSﬁW%WﬁWWWWWWWWE} ud
IFHET  WRPR gRT FiRa Rsar smoem |-



Seedl &R SRl &1 faaRe

foe ¢5 T ¥ Auwre B AR ¥ qeu gEee § gfE @ o) S0 9aT AR
et /gfEmel ¥ gfE @ AT aR A S KA ¥ ge N g e man &
3} / Sezer / SuTeTe / A-uRe /g WO @ 9| /e /gleu s €
R T FAMUIIS T 96 S aeil 9@/ W Ay |

=g oY, TS o & el aer @ Al @ (@9 @ W) s, 1994
¥ deE ev @ for U IomET &9 Rl WeR & AR & (999 v )
(eFeier) s, 2022 @1 oW fbar T R TW e g1 A woEE &5 el
TP I o9rdl T ¥ B B H g B |

fadrae gafa Seedl &1 9T &R © |

I
(DT TEe)
= (RfY, < g Rl )



faxia smo=

IS o 4 el WeR @ Hinl @ (a7 vd W ) (deie) faes, 2022 @
fafea yaTal & Pt ¥ R aifiie snadt @ e IS & faeelt 3

H'I%la ﬁ@l @ Iﬁﬁﬂl O TQT |
( |35i|5|)

= (A, < @ R )



yeaaraifora fous e sia=

Ww&ﬁraﬁﬁ:ﬁw%#ﬁﬁm(ﬁ@ﬁ)(ﬁﬁaﬂﬁm,zo&
Rl el TaTRIeTRET wR fAurd ufes |fus & AT T2 SR § |
s

TEI)
W (R, = v Rl ar)



BILL NO. O "7 of 2022

THE MINISTERS OF THE GOVERNMENT OF NATIONAL CAPITAL TERRITORY OF DELHI
(SALARIES AND ALLOWANCES) (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2022

A
BILL

Further to amend the Ministers of the Government of the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and
Allowances) Act, 1994,

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the National Capital Territory of Delhi in the Seventy-second
Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement. - (1) This Act may be called the Ministers of the Government of
the National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Act, 2022.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Lieutenant Governor may, by notification in the Official
Gazette, appoint.

2. Amendment of section 3. — In the Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi

(Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1994, (Delhi Act 8 of 1995) (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section
3.-

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “twenty thousand rupees”, the words “sixty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “one thousand five hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;

(c) in sub-section (3), for the words “eighteen thousand rupees”, the words “thirty thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;

(d) in sub-section (4), for the words “fifty thousand rupees”, the words “one lakh rupees” shall be substituted;
(e) after sub-section (4), the following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely; -

“(5) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees one lakh as one time allowance for purchase of
laptop, personal computer, printer, mobile handset etc. for each term of office as a Member.

(6) There shall be paid to each Minister a sum of rupees twenty five thousand per month as secretarial
assistance.”

3. Amendment of section 4. —In the principal Act, in section 4, for the words “four thousand rupees” the
words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

4, Amendment of section 6.-

(i) In sub-section (4), for the words “rupees two thousand rupees”, the words “rupees ten thousand”
shall be substituted
(ii) After sub-section (4) the following sub-sections shall be inserted. —

“(5) A Minister shall be entitled to a conveyance advance up to twelve lakh rupees for purchase of
conveyance to be repayable within his term as a Member.

(6) The rate of interest for the advance referred to in sub-section (5) and the mode of recovery thereon shall
be such as may be determined by the Government, with the prior approval of the President.”




STATEMENT OF OBJECTS & REASONS

For some time past, there has been persistent demand from the MLAs for
the increase in their salaries and perks/ facilities having regard to the increase
in the price index. It was also felt that salaries/ perks/ facilities of Ministers/
Speaker/ Deputy Speaker/ Leader of Opposition / Chief Whip are a bit

inadequate which should be upgraded and enhanced to a commensurate
extent.

For the purpose, the Ministers of the Government of National Capital
Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Bill, 2022, has been
initiated to amend the Ministers of the Government of National Capital
Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances) Act, 1994. This Bill proposes to
increase the salaries, allowances & other facilities of the Ministers of the
Legislative Assembly of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi,
so as to facilitate them to work effectively.

The Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

L
(K

ilash Gahlot)
Minister (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

For the implementation of the proposals contained in Ministers of the
Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi (Salaries and Allowances)
(Amendment) Bill, 2022, there will be an additional annual recurring

expenditure from the Consolidated Fund of the National Capital Territory of
Delhi.

(A
(xﬁm;

Minister (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)



MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

The Ministers of the Government of National Capital Territory of Delhi
(Salaries and Allowances) (Amendment) Bill, 2022, does not seek to confer

power of legislation on any subordinate functionaries.

[t

(Kailash Gahlot)
Minister (Law, Justice & Legislative Affairs)



